202148 International Building-Related Codes

Inspection for which no fee is specifically

indicated (per hour with one-hour minimum) >100.00
l Inspection schedule fee (free on-line) $3.00
| Permit processing fee $10.00
| Permit extension fee 50% of permit (plus cost of permit)

Re-inspection fee $51.50

Permit refund fee

Open permit review fee

Permit amendment fee

Link child permit to parent permit fee

Contractor number research fee

Duplicate copy of city issued electrical license

personnel—5$15.00/hour/staff (with one-h
min.); custodian servic

Secs. 10-55—10-60. - Reserved.

ARTICLE VII. - MECHANICA

ernational Mechanical Code, promulgated by the International Code
adopted and incorporated in this article by reference as if fully set forth,

International Mechanical Code.

odel codes to any building, electrical, fuel gas, mechanical, plumbing,

Page 116 of 187



202148 International Building-Related Codes

Sec. 10-62. - Amendments to the adopted chapters of the International Mechanical Code (26482021).

Additions to the International Mechanical Code (IMC) are shown as_underlined text. Deletions of the

IMC are shown as bracketed [strikethroughs].
Section 202, GENERAL DEFINITIONS, is amended by adding the following definition:

NFPA 70. The National Electrical Code, as amended by Article VI of this Code.

Section 301.10, Electrical, is amended as follows:

301.10 Electrical. Electrical wiring, controls and connections to equipment'and appliances regulated
by this code shall be in accordance with NFPA 70._All wiring, including control wiring, exposed to
weather shall be installed in a raceway approved for the environments

Section 304, INSTALLATION, is amended by adding Section 304.13.Installation at gas walve, as follows:

304.13 Installation at gas valve. Minimum Schedule 40 metallic pipe shall be installed at the gas
valve and extended a minimum of two inches outside thé gas furnace and gas rooftop uhit's casing
and may be connected to an approved listed flexible gas connector.

Section 306.3, Appliances in attics, is amended by adding 306.3.2 Aceess for cooling or heating appliance,
as follows:

306.3.2 Access for cooling or heating. appliance. For aew —one-and two-family residential
occupanmes and townhomes W|th newlv mstalled coollnq or heatlnq appllances in the attic space, in
A vith-a permanent ladder, ferl-fold-
away Iadder or direct access door opening from the house on the same floor level shall be installed.

Section 307.2.1, Condensate disposal, is deleted‘and replaced with the following text:

307.2.1 Condensate disposal. Condensate disposal shall be in accordance with Chapter 34, Section

34-274 of the Cltv Code of San Anton|o [9&4densate4r9ma”—eee+mg%eﬂsand—evaperatem—shaﬂ—be

Section 307:2.2, Drain pipe materials,and sizes, is amended as follows; All other code text remains as is:

307.2.2 Drain pipe materials and sizes. Components of the condensate disposal system shall be
ABS, cast iron,_copperiand copper alloy, CPVC, galvanized-steel-copper—copperalloy;-cross-linked
polyethylene, galvanized steel, PE-RT, polyethylene, ABS-CPVC.-PVC-or-polypropylene, pipe-PVC

or PVDE.pipe or tubing./Components shall be selected for the pressure and temperature rating of the
installationy Joints and‘connections shall be made in accordance with the applicable provisions of
Chapter 7 ofithe Intérnational Plumbing Code relative to the material type. Condensate waste and
drain line size shall be not less than %4-inch pipe size internal-diameter-and shall not decrease in size
from the drain‘pan connection to the place of condensate disposal. Where the drain pipes from more
than one unit are manifolded together for condensate drainage, the pipe or tubing shall be sized in
accordance with Table 307.2.2. Primary drain lines located in any unconditioned space, except for
crawl spaces, shall be insulated with foam plastic rubber based insulation or approved material with a
minimum thickness of 3/8 inch.

Section 307.2.4.1, Ductless mini-split system traps, is amended as follows:

307.2.4.1 Ductless m|n|-spI|t system traps Ductless m|n| spllt equ|pment that produces condensate
shall be [p : in accordance with
their manufacturers recommendatlons

Page 117 of 187



202148 International Building-Related Codes

Section 606.2, Where required, is amended as follows; All other code text remains as is:

606.2 Where required. Smoke detectors shall be installed where indicated in Section 606.2.1 through
606.2.3 or_in_accordance with NFPA 90A "Standard for the Installation of /Air Conditioning and
Ventilating Systems."

Heating and Air Conditioning (Mechanical)

Heating and Air Conditioning (Mechanical) License Fees

Mestor

Master Renewal—City License per year $150.00

Technician (journeyman) (may only perform

. . $35.00
work not requiring a permit)—Renewal

Page 118 of 187



202148 International Building-Related Codes

Heating and Air Conditioning (Mechanical) Inspection Fees

Basic Heating and Air Conditioning
(Mechanical) Permit (Basic Fee). See section 10- $50.00
39 for new residential construction basic '

heating and air conditioning permit fee.

Residential (new systems) (includes inspection

fee)

Each Additional System (includes inspection
fee)

Roof-Top Unit (gas or electric)

Gas furnace; gas wall furnace; gas unit heater;

gas radiant heater; gas boiler (steam); gas floor

furnace; commercial gas dryer; gas boiler (hot
water); gas duct heater (per each item)

Condensing unit; condensing unit/heat pump;
indoor condensing unit; cooling coil;

commercial exhaust fan; condenser (no

compressor); commercial electric dryer; fan co

$6.25

ot water coil;
condenser

makeup air systems); condensing unit (mobile
homes and manufactured housing); any
regulated device for which no specific fee is
listed; replacement of any device which
originally required a permit (per each item)

Page 119 of 187



202148 International Building-Related Codes

Curtain Fire Damper; Smoke Damper; Duct
Outlet; Ceiling Fire Damper; Smoke/Fire $2.00
Damper (per each item)

Building-related and Fire Codes Appeals and Advisory Board Fees

Building-related and Fire Codes Appeal Fee $155.00

Special Heating and Air Conditioning (Mechanical) Fees

After-hour Inspection Fee (per hour with 1 hour
minimum)

Inspection for which no fee is specifically
indicated (per hour with 1 hour minimum)

Permit Processing Fee

Inspection Schedule Fee (Free on-line)

Mechanical Plan Review—This fee is charged to

review plans without a building permit (per $100.00

hour with a 1 hour minimum)

Permit Extension Fee:
of permit)

Re-inspection Fe

rmit (plus cost of permit)

$51.50

$3.00/Permit

$150.00

$50.00

$10.00

5/hr (daily min. fee of $250; Max fee of $1000); Security Personnel:
minimum); DSD Staff: $30/hour/staff (with 1 hour min.); Custodian
Service: $15/hour (with 2 hour min.)

Secs. 10-64—10-70.

ARTICLE VIII. - GAS CODE

Sec. 10-71. - Adoption of International Fuel Gas Code (20182021).

Page 120 of 187





